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17 May 2021 

Request for Information. 

Thank you for your request received on 6 April in which you asked: 

Hello, under FOI please list the leak inquiries conducted by the Senedd/Assembly 
commission since the beginning of devolution. For each one,  

I. note the topic of the leak,  
II. duration of the inquiry,  
III. whether the source of the leak was found, and  
IV. whether disciplinary action or any other action was taken as a result.  

 

Our response to your request is below.  

 
Your request asks for information since the beginning of devolution in Wales. The Senedd 
Commission was established in 2007.  Only a very limited amount of information created 
before 2007 is, therefore, held by the Senedd Commission.  The bulk of the records 
relating to the period between 1999 and 2007 are likely to be held by the Welsh 
Government. You may wish to contact the Welsh Government in relation to that period.  
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1.  
I. Leak in 2003 of the Audit Committee Report on the National Council for Education 

and Training. 
II. We hold no recorded information relating to this part of your request. 
III. We hold no recorded information relating to this part of your request. 
IV. We hold no recorded information relating to this part of your request. 

 
2.  

I. Increase in the firearms capability deployed on the estate.  
II. The inquiry started on 24 November 2015.  We hold no record of the end date. 
III. We hold no recorded information relating to this part of your request. 
IV. We hold no recorded information relating to this part of your request. 

 
3.  

I. Leak of a Standards Committee report.  
II. We hold no recorded information relating to this part of your request.  
III. The source of the leak was not found.  
IV. See III above.   

 
4.  

I. Leak of a Commissioner for Standards report. 
II. We hold no recorded information relating to this part of your request. 
III. The source of the leak was not found. 
IV. See III above.   

 

Yours sincerely, 

 
Freedom of Information Manager  
Welsh Parliament  



Your request has been considered according to the principles set out in the Code of 
Practice on Public Access to Information.  If you have any questions regarding this 
response please contact me.  If you feel you have cause for complaint, please follow the 
guidance below. 

Cause for concern or complaint with your FOI response? 

If you are dissatisfied with the Welsh Parliament’s handling of your request, you can 
request an internal review within 40 working days of the date of this response.  Requests 
for an internal review should be addressed to the Freedom of Information Manager at:  

Information-request@senedd.wales or in writing to 

Welsh Parliament      
Governance and Assurance   
Cardiff Bay  
Cardiff  
CF99 1SN 

If you are not content with the outcome of the internal review, you have the right to 
apply directly to the Information Commissioner for a decision. The Information 
Commissioner can be contacted at: 

Information Commissioner’s Office  
Wycliffe House  
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire 
SK9 5AF 
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