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13 March 2020 
  
Request for Information. 
 
Thank you for your request received on 18 February in which you asked: 
 
Good afternoon, I am seeking the following information under the Freedom of 
Information Act for the 2018 and 2019 years, as well as 2020 to date.  
 

1. A month by month breakdown of the total GBP cost of alcoholic drinks 
sold in the Member's Tea Room at the Senedd  
 

2. A breakdown of which alcoholic beverages were sold each month and 
in what quantity  

 
3. A month by month breakdown of overall revenue generated by the 

Member's Tea Room over the specified years in GBP  
 

4. A price list / menu for the three relevant years (alternatively a single 
price list should these prices have remained consistent)  

 
5. If possible in addition to the above questions, could you specify the 

total value of alcohol sales on the dates listed below: - March 20th 
2019 - April 2nd 2019 - October 19th 2019 - December 12th 2019 - 
January 23rd 2020  

 
If possible, please could you provide this information in the form of an Excel 
document. If I can clarify any questions I have asked further, please do let me 
know. I look forward to your response  
Please see the response below. 
 

1. Information not held 
 
2. Information not held 

mailto:Ceisiadau-wybodaeth@cynulliad.cymru
mailto:Information-request@assembly.wales
mailto:MynediadAtWybodaeth@Cynulliad.cymru%20Assembly-Accesstoinformation@assembly.wales
mailto:MynediadAtWybodaeth@Cynulliad.cymru%20Assembly-Accesstoinformation@assembly.wales


 
3. The total annual sales, with a monthly average, for the Members’ Tea 

Rooms in Ty Hywel and the Senedd are as follows: 
 

  Monthly 
average 

September 2017 – August 2018 £4,150 £348.83 
September 2018 – August 2019 £2,992 £249.33 
September 2019 – January 2020 £1,721 £143.41 

 
4. Please see Annex attached to this response containing tariff 

information 
 

5. Information not held 
 
Yours sincerely 
 
 
Freedom of Information Manager  
National Assembly for Wales 



Your request has been considered according to the principles set out in the 
Code of Practice on Public Access to Information.  If you have any questions 
regarding this response please contact me.  If you feel you have cause for 
complaint, please follow the guidance below. 
 
Cause for concern or complaint with your FOI response? 
 
If you are dissatisfied with the Assembly’s handling of your request, you can 
request an internal review within 40 working days of the date of this 
response.  Requests for an internal review should be addressed to the 
Freedom of Information Manager at:  
Information-request@assembly.wales or in writing to 
The National Assembly for Wales      
Governance and Assurance  
Cardiff Bay 
Cardiff                                                                                                                                                                       
CF99 1NA 
 
If you are not content with the outcome of the internal review, you have the 
right to apply directly to the Information Commissioner for a decision. The 
Information Commissioner can be contacted at: 
 
 Information Commissioner’s Office  
 Wycliffe House  
 Water Lane 
 Wilmslow 
 Cheshire 
 SK9 5AF 
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