
Oral Assembly Questions tabled on 19 November 2002
for answer on 3 December 2002

R Signifies the Member has declared an interest.
W Signifies that the question was tabled in Welsh.

(Self identifying Question no. shown in brackets)

To ask the Assembly First Minister 

1. Janet Davies (South Wales West); What steps is the First Minister taking to ensure that 
subject committees are fully aware of developments at the European Union level of 
government, which affect their work and decisions. (OAQ20721) WITHDRAWN

2. Ieuan Wyn Jones (Ynys Môn); Will the First Minister make a statement on recent 
discussions between himself, the Secretary of State for Wales, and the UK Government 
regarding the further transfer of functions from Westminster to the National Assembly. 
(OAQ20749)

3. Owen John Thomas (South Wales Central); How much money was spent by the 
Assembly Government during the last year on advisors. (OAQ20724) W

4. Janet Ryder (North Wales); Will the First Minister make a statement on the funding of the 
free bus pass scheme in Wales. (OAQ20714)

5. Helen Mary Jones (Llanelli); What discussions has the First Minister had with the Health 
Minister about the financing of healthcare in Carmarthen. (OAQ20716)

6. Mick Bates (Montgomeryshire); In what ways is the First Minister's government integrating 
the economic needs of Wales with its educational needs. (OAQ20728)

7. David Ian Jones (North Wales); Would the First Minister make a statement on 
arrangements made by the Welsh Ambulance Service to deal with a major terrorist incident in 
Wales. (OAQ20725)

8. Geraint Davies (Rhondda); What is the First Minister doing to ensure communities which 
need the greatest economic assistance are receiving it. (OAQ20748)

9. Brian Gibbons (Aberavon); Has the Welsh Assembly Government made any 
representations to the UK Government in relation to the consultation on anti-social tenants. 



(OAQ20723)

10. Rhodri Glyn Thomas (Carmarthen East and Dinefwr); Can the First Minister make a 
statement on the priorities of his cabinet up until the next Assembly Elections in 2003. 
(OAQ20747)

11. Nicholas Bourne (Mid and West Wales); Will the Minister make a statement on his 
administration's Health Care policies. (OAQ20742)

12. Richard Edwards (Preseli Pembrokeshire); Will the First Minister make a statement on 
how the Government proposes to improve public transport services in Pembrokeshire. 
(OAQ20729)

13. Christine Chapman (Cynon Valley); Will the First Minister make a statement about the 
benefits of retaining the final stage of the World Rally Championships in Wales. (OAQ20718)

14. Ann Jones (Vale of Clwyd); Will the Minister make a statement on the NHS (Wales) Bill. 
(OAQ20712)

15. Janice Gregory (Ogmore); What extra resources is the Welsh Assembly Government 
making available for the ambulance service in Wales. (OAQ20730)
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