
Motions and Amendments for Debate on 8 March 2005

Motions Tabled on 1 March 2005

NDM2323 Jane Hutt (Vale of Glamorgan)

To propose that the National Assembly:

Under Section 88B of the Local Government Finance Act, 1988, and in accordance with 
Standing Order 21.11, approves the Local Government Finance (Wales) Special Grant 
Report No 6 (Wales 2004) which was laid in the Table Office on 28 February 2005.

NDM2324 Sue Essex (Cardiff North)

That the National Assembly, in accordance with Standing Order 21.6, approves the changes 
to Main Expenditure Groups for the financial year 2004-05 

The following tables were e-mailed to Assembly Members on 1 March 2005:

Table 1 shows the proposed changes of existing Assembly provision between Main Expenditure 
Groups;

Table 2 shows the proposed revised provisions for Main Expenditure Groups taking account of 
transfers to and from Government Departments; and

Table 3 shows the proposed breakdown of the carry-forward provision by Main Expenditure Group 
and the proposed final 2004-05 provision for each Main Expenditure Group.

NDM2325 Sue Essex (Cardiff North)

To propose that the National Assembly, in accordance with Standing Order 21.5, adopts the 
supplementary budget for the financial years 2005-2006, 2006-2007 and 2007-2008, laid in 
the Table Office and e-mailed to Assembly Members on 1 March.

NDM2336 Jane Hutt (Vale of Glamorgan)

To propose that the National Assembly for Wales:

Considers the principle of The National Assistance (Assessment of Resources) 
(Amendment) (Wales) Regulations 2005 a copy of which was laid in Table on 10 February 
2005.

NDM2326 Jane Hutt (Vale of Glamorgan)



To propose that the National Assembly for Wales:

1. Considers the report of the Legislation Committee laid in the Table Office on 22 February, 
2005 in relation to the draft Regulations The National Assistance (Assessment of 
Resources) (Amendment) (Wales) Regulations 2005; and

2. Approves that, The National Assistance (Assessment of Resources) (Amendment) 
(Wales) Regulations 2005 is made in accordance with:
a) The draft Regulations laid in the Table Office on 10 February 2005
b) Regulatory Appraisal laid in the Table Office on 10 February 2005

NDM2327 Jane Hutt (Vale of Glamorgan)

To propose that the National Assembly for Wales:

Considers the principle of The National Assistance (Sums for Personal Requirements) 
(Wales) Regulations 2005 a copy of which was laid in Table on 10 February 2005.

NDM2328 Jane Hutt (Vale of Glamorgan)

To propose that the National Assembly for Wales:

1. Considers the report of the Legislation Committee laid in the Table on 22 February, 2005 
in relation to the draft Regulations The National Assistance (Sums for Personal 
Requirements) (Wales) Regulations 2005; and

2. Approves that, The National Assistance (Sums for Personal Requirements) (Wales) 
Regulations 2005 is made in accordance with:
a) The draft Regulations laid in the Table Office on 10 February 2005
b) Regulatory Appraisal laid in the Table Office on 10 February 2005

NDM2329 Jane Hutt (Vale of Glamorgan)

To propose that the National Assembly for Wales:

Considers the principle of The Local Government (Best Value Performance Indicators) 
(Wales) Order 2005 a copy of which was laid in Table on 16 February 2005

NDM2330 Jane Hutt (Vale of Glamorgan)

To propose that the National Assembly for Wales:

1. Considers the report of the Legislation Committee laid in the Table on 22 February, 2005 



in relation to the draft Order The Local Government (Best Value Performance Indicators) 
(Wales) Order 2005; and

2. Approves that, The Local Government (Best Value Performance Indicators) (Wales) 
Order 2005 is made in accordance with:
a) The draft Order laid in the Table Office on 16 February 2005
b) Regulatory Appraisal laid in the Table Office on 10 February 2005

NDM2331 Jane Hutt (Vale of Glamorgan)

To propose that the National Assembly for Wales:

Considers the principle of The Local Government (Best Value Performance Indicators) 
(Wales) (Revocation) Order 2005 a copy of which was laid in Table on 11 February 2005

NDM2332 Jane Hutt (Vale of Glamorgan)

To propose that the National Assembly for Wales:

1. Considers the report of the Legislation Committee laid in the Table on 22 February, 2005 
in relation to the draft Order The Local Government (Best Value Performance Indicators) 
(Wales) (Revocation) Order 2005; and

2. Approves that, The Local Government (Best Value Performance Indicators) (Wales) 
(Revocation) Order 2005 is made in accordance with:
a) The draft Order laid in the Table Office on 11 February 2005
b) Regulatory Appraisal laid in the Table Office on 10 February 2005

NDM2333 Jane Hutt (Vale of Glamorgan)

To propose that the National Assembly for Wales acting under Standing Order 29.3 (iii):

Considers the principle of The Radioactive Substances (National Security)(Wales) 
Directions 2005 a copy of which was laid in Table Office and emailed to Assembly Member 
on 1 March 2005.

NDM2334 Jane Hutt (Vale of Glamorgan)

To propose that the National Assembly for Wales acting under Standing Order 29.3(iii):

Approves that The Radioactive Substances (National Security)(Wales) Directions 2005 is 
made in accordance with the draft Directions laid in the Table Office and emailed to 
Assembly Members on 1 March 2005.



NDM2335 Jane Hutt (Vale of Glamorgan)

To propose that the National Assembly for Wales, acting under Standing Order 24.25:

1.
a) Considers the report of the Legislation Committee laid in the Table Office, and emailed to 
Assembly Members on 1 March 2005 on the draft Order The Public Audit (Wales) Act 2004 
(Commencement No. 2 and Transitional Provisions and Savings) Order 2005; and

b) Approves The Public Audit (Wales) Act 2004 (Commencement No. 2 and Transitional 
Provisions and Savings) Order 2005 is made in accordance with:
i) the draft Order laid in the Table Office on 23 February 2005
ii) Regulatory Appraisal laid in the Table Office and emailed to Assembly Members on 1 
March 2005 

2.
a) Considers the report of the Legislation Committee laid in the Table Office, and emailed to 
Assembly Members on 1 March 2005 on the draft Regulations The Products of Animal 
Origin (Third Country Imports) (Wales) Regulations 2005; and

b) Approves The Products of Animal Origin (Third Country Imports) (Wales) Regulations 
2005 is made in accordance with:
i) the draft Regulations laid in the Table Office on 22 February 2005
ii) Regulatory Appraisal laid in the Table Office and emailed to Assembly Members on 1 
March 2005 

3.
a) Considers the report of the Legislation Committee laid in the Table Office, on 8 February 
2005 on the draft Order The Diseases of Animals (Approved Disinfectants) (Amendment) 
(Wales) Order 2005; and

b) Approves The Diseases of Animals (Approved Disinfectants) (Amendment) (Wales) 
Order 2005 is made in accordance with:
i) the draft Order laid in the Table Office on 26 January 2005
ii) Regulatory Appraisal laid in the Table Office on 2 February 2005 
iii) the Memorandum of Correction laid in the Table Office on 14 February 2005

4.
a) Considers the report of the Legislation Committee laid in the Table Office, on 8 February 
2005 on the draft Regulations The Salmonella in Laying Flocks (Survey Powers) (Wales) 
Regulations 2005; and

b) Approves The Salmonella in Laying Flocks (Survey Powers) (Wales) Regulations 2005 is 
made in accordance with:
i) the draft Regulations laid in the Table Office on 26 January 2005



ii) Regulatory Appraisal laid in the Table Office on 2 February 2005 
iii) the Memorandum of Correction laid in the Table Office on 14 February 2005

5.
a) Considers the report of the Legislation Committee laid in the Table Office, on 22 February 
2005 on the draft Regulations Community Health Councils (Amendment) Regulations 2005; 
and

b) Approves Community Health Councils (Amendment) Regulations 2005 is made in 
accordance with:
i) the draft Regulations laid in the Table Office on 2 February 2005
ii) Regulatory Appraisal laid in the Table Office on 2 February 2005 
iii) the Memorandum of Correction laid in the Table Office on 22 February 2005

6.
a) Considers the report of the Legislation Committee laid in the Table Office, on 22 February 
2005 on the draft Regulations The Dairy Produce Quotas (Wales) Regulations 2005; and

b) Approves The Dairy Produce Quotas (Wales) Regulations 2005 is made in accordance 
with:
i) the draft Regulations laid in the Table Office on 2 February 2005
ii) Regulatory Appraisal laid in the Table Office on 2 February 2005 
iii) the Memorandum of Correction laid in the Table Office and emailed to Assembly 
Members on 1 March 2005

Amendments tabled on 2 March 2004

To propose that the Assembly resolves to adopt the following amendments to motions:

NDM2336

1. Jocelyn Davies (South Wales East)

Believes that making provision for free personal care for the elderly would ensure their 
dignity and avoid the humiliation of means testing.

Amendments to Orders Tabled on 3 March 2005

NDM2326

To propose that the National Assembly for Wales resolves to make the following 
amendments to The National Assistance (Assessment of Resources) (Amendment) (Wales) 
Regulations 2005 laid in the Table Office on 10 February 2005:



In regulation ‘20A Capital limit – Wales’ delete ‘£21,000’ and replace with ‘£60,000’ and in 
regulation ‘28A Calculation of tariff income from capital – Wales’ delete ‘£21,000’ and 
replace with ‘£60,000’.

Statement of Purpose and Costs

Purpose

The purpose of the amendment is to further extend free personal care to those who need it 
by raising the upper capital limit before which councils can compel someone to sell their 
home to pay for care. 

Costs

The cost of the proposed amendment is £23.4 million. This is based on the premise that 
every £1,000 increase to the upper capital limit costs the Welsh Assembly Government 
£600,000. These figures have been calculated based upon costing work already undertaken 
by the Welsh Assembly Government


	Local Disk
	To propose that the National Assembly:


